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THE GOSPEL ACCORDING TO MARK 
 
Mark 1:1-13 
The Prologue 
 
Mark 1:14 - 9:50 
The Presentation of the Servant in Galilee 

 
Mark 2:1-12 
The Curing of the Paralytic 
 
1)  And again He entered into Capernaum after many 
days; and it was heard that He is in a house. 
 
2)  And immediately many were gathered together, so 
that they no longer had room, not even near the door; 
and He was speaking to them the Word. 
 
3)  And they are coming to Him bringing a paralytic, 
being carried by four men. 
 
4)  And not being able to come near to Him on account 
of the crowd, they uncovered the roof where He was, 
and having dug through they let down the bed upon 
which the paralytic was lying. 
 
5)  And when Jesus saw their faith, He says to the 
paralytic, "Child, your sins have been forgiven you." 
 
6)  Now some of the scribes there were sitting, and 
reasoning in their hearts, 
 
7)  "Why does this one speak blasphemies this way?  
Who is able to forgive sins, except One, God?" 
 
8)  And immediately Jesus having known in His spirit 
that they are reasoning this way in themselves, He said 
to them, "Why these things are you reasoning in your 
hearts? 
 
9)  "Which is easier to say to the paralytic, 'The sins 
have been forgiven you,' or to say, 'Rise and take up 
your bed and walk?' 
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10)  "But in order that you might know that the Son of 
Man has authority to forgive sins upon the earth," He 
says to the paralytic, 
 
11)  "I say to you, Rise and take up your bed and go 
into your house." 
 
12)  And he was raised up immediately, and after 
having taken up the bed, he went out before all; so that 
all were amazed and were glorifying God, saying that, 
"Never did we see it this way before." 
 
Mark 2:13-17 
The Calling of Levi 
 
13)  And He went out again along the sea; and all the 
crowd was coming to Him, and He was teaching them. 
 
14)  And while passing by, He saw Levi the son of 
Alpheus sitting at the tax office, and He says to him, 
"Follow Me."  And having risen up, he followed Him. 
 
15)  And it happened while He reclined in his house, 
and many tax collectors and sinners were reclining with 
Jesus and His disciples; for they were many, and they 
followed Him. 
 
16)  And after the scribes and Pharisees saw Him eating 
with tax collectors and sinners, they were saying to His 
disciples, "Why is it that He is eating and drinking with 
the tax collectors and sinners?" 
 
17)  And after having heard, Jesus says to them, "The 
ones being strong do not have need of a physician, but 
the ones having sickness.  I did not come to call the 
righteous but sinners unto repentance." 
 
Mark 2:18-22 
The Confrontation over Fasting 
 
18)  And the disciples of John and the ones of the 
Pharisees were fasting.  And they come and say to Him, 
"Why are the disciples of John and the ones of the 
Pharisees fasting, but Your disciples are not fasting?"
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19)  And Jesus said to them, "Are not the sons of the 
bridechamber able to fast in which time the bridegroom 
is with them?  What time they have the bridegroom 
with them, they are not able to fast. 
 
20)  "But days will come whenever the bridegroom 
should be taken away from them, and then they will fast 
in those days. 
 
21)  "And no one sews a piece of unshrunk cloth upon 
an old garment; but if not, the thing filling it up takes 
away the new from the old, and it becomes a worse tear. 
 
22)  "And no one puts new wine into old wineskins; but 
if not the new wine bursts the wineskins, and the wine 
pours out, and the wineskins will be destroyed; but new 
wine must be put into new wineskins." 
 
Mark 2:23-28 
The Confrontation over the Sabbath 
 
23)  And it happened, as He was going through the 
grain fields in the sabbaths, and His disciples began to 
make way picking the heads of grain. 
 
24)  And the Pharisees were saying to Him, "Behold, 
why do they do in the sabbaths what is not lawful?" 
 
25)  And He was saying to them, "Did you never read 
what David did, when he had need and became hungry 
he and the ones with him? 
 
26)  "How he entered into the house of God during 
Abiathar the high priest, and he ate the Loaves of the 
Presentation, which is not lawful to eat except for the 
priests and he gave also to the ones being with him?" 
 
27)  And He was saying to them, "The sabbath was 
created on account of man, not man on account of the 
sabbath. 
 
28)  "So then the Son of Man is also Lord of the 
sabbath." 
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18)  Kai;   h\san    oiJ   maqhtai;    jIwavnnou   kai;   oiJ   [tẁn]   Farisaivwn 
  And     were     the    disciples        of John     and    the    [the]    of Pharisees 
 
  (Farisaìoi)   nhsteuvonte":   kai;   e[rcontai   kai;   levgousin   aujtw`/,   Diativ 
  (Pharisees)               fasting;           and    they come     and      they say     to him,     Why 
 
  (dia;   tiv)               oiJ   maqhtai;    jIwavnnou   kai;   oiJ   (maqhtai;)   tẁn 
  (on account of what)   the    disciples       of John      and    the    (disciples)      the 
 
  Farisaivwn   nhsteuvousin,   oiJ   de;     soi;    maqhtai;   ouj   nhsteuvousi(n)É 
  of Pharisees        are fasting,       the   but   of You    disciples    not      are fasting? 
 
19)  kai;   ei\pen   aujtoì"   oJ    jIhsou`",   Mh;   duvnantai   oiJ   uiJoi;   tou`    
  and      said      to them   the      Jesus,       Not      are able      the   sons     the 
 
  numfw`no",        ejn     w|/      oJ    numfivo"    metÆ   aujtw`n   ejsti(n),  nhsteuveinÉ 
  of bridechamber,   in   which   the   bridegroom   with       them          is,             to fast? 
 
  o{son   crovnon   [meq j   eJautẁn]     e[cousi(n)   to;n   numfivon,   (metÆ   aujtw`n) 
  what        time      [with    themselves]    they have      the   bridegroom,   (with      them) 
 
  ouj    duvnantai   nhsteuvein: 
  not   they are able       to fast. 
 
20)  ejleuvsontai   de;   hJmevrai     o{tan             ajparqh`/           ajpÆ   aujtw`n   oJ 
  will come         but       days     whenever   should be taken away   from     them    the 
 
  numfivo",     kai;   tovte   nhsteuvsousin   ejn   ejkeivnai~   (ejkeivnh/)   taì~ 
  bridegroom,   and      then       they will fast       in         those           (that)         the 
 
  (th`/)     hJmevrai~.   (hJmevra/)  
  (in the)      days.           (day) 
 
21)  [kai;]   oujdei;"   ejpivblhma   rJavkou"   ajgnavfou   ejpirravptei   (ejpiravptei) 
  [and]     no one         piece         of cloth     unshrunk           sews                 (sews) 
 
  ejpi;    iJmativw/   (iJmavtion)   palaiw/̀:   (palaiovn)   eij   de;   mhv,      ai[rei     to; 
  upon   garment     (garment)         old;              (old)         if    but    not,   takes away   the 
 
  plhvrwma   (ajpÆ)   aujtou`   to;   kaino;n   tou ̀  palaiou`,   kai;   ceìron   scivsma 
  filling up     (from)      of it      the      new        the        of old,      and      worse         tear 
 
  givnetai. 
  takes place. 
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22)  kai;   oujdei;"   bavllei   oi\non   nevon   eij"    ajskou;"   palaiouv":   eij   de;   mhv, 
  and     no one        puts       wine      new     into    wineskins         old;          if     but   not, 
 
  rJhvssei   (rJhvxei)     oJ   oi\no"   [oJ   nevo~]   tou;"   ajskou;",   kai;   oJ   oi\no" 
  bursts     (will burst)   the   wine    [the    new]       the    wineskins,   and   the   wine 
 
  ejkceivtai   (ajpovllutai)   kai;   oiJ     ajskoiv      [ajpolou`ntai:]    ajlla;   oi\non 
  is poured out,   (perishes)      and    the   wineskins   [will be destroyed;]    but       wine 
 
  nevon   eij"    ajskou;"   kainouv"    [blhtevon]. 
  new      into   wineskins       new       [must be put]. 
 
 
23)  Kai;   ejgevneto   (aujto;n   ejn   toi`"   savbbasin)   paraporeuvesqai   aujto;n   ejn 
  and    it happened     (him      in      the        sabbaths)                 to go                  him       in 
 
  toi`"   [savbbasi]     dia;    twǹ   sporivmwn,   kai;   (oiJ   maqhtai;   aujtou`) 
  the        [sabbaths]    through   the     grain fields,    and    (the    disciples     of him) 
 
  h[rxanto   [oiJ   maqhtai;   aujtou`]   oJdo;n   poieiǹ   tivllonte"   tou;" 
  began         [the     disciples    of Him]    way     to make       picking         the    
 
  stavcua".  
  heads of grain. 
 
 
24)  kai;   oiJ   Farisai`oi    e[legon     aujtẁ/,     [Ide,      tiv   poiou`sin   [ejn]   toi`" 
  and    the     Pharisees    were saying   to Him,   Behold,   why     do they       [in]      the 
 
  savbbasin      o}    oujk   e[xesti(n)É 
  sabbaths        what    not      is lawful? 
 
 
25)  kai;   [aujto;~]    e[legen   (levgei)   aujtoì",   Oujdevpote   ajnevgnwte     tiv 
  and        [He]     was saying   (says)      to them,         Never       did you read   what 
 
  ejpoivhse(n)   Dabivd,   (Daui;d)   o{te   creivan   e[sce(n)   kai;    ejpeivnasen 
  did                    David,     (David)   when      need        he had      and   became hungry 
 
  aujto;"   kai;       oiJ     metÆ   aujtou`;  
  he            and   the ones   with       him? 
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26)  pw`"   eijsh`lqen   eij"   to;n   oi\kon   tou ̀  Qeou`     ejpi;    jAbiaqa;r   [tou`] 
  how    he entered    into     the     house      the   of God   during    Abiathar      [the] 
 
  ajrcierevw",   kai;   tou;"   a[rtou"   th`"    proqevsew"    e[fagen,   ou}"   oujk 
  high priest,       and      the       loaves       the    of presentation      he ate,    which   not 
 
  e[xesti(n)   fageìn   eij   mh;   tou;"   iJereu`si,   (iJereì")   kai;   e[dwke(n)   kai; 
  is lawful          to eat      if     not      the        priests,      (priests)     and     he gave      also 
 
  toi`"          su;n   aujtw`/   ou\si(n)É 
  to the ones    with     him       being? 
 
 
27)  kai;      e[legen     aujtoi`",   To;   savbbaton       dia;       to;n   a[nqrwpon 
  and   he was saying   to them,   The       sabbath   on account of   the          man 
 
  ejgevneto,     (kai;)   oujc   oJ    a[nqrwpo"       dia;         to;   savbbaton:  
  was created,   (and)     not    the         man       on account of    the       sabbath; 
 
 
28)  w{ste   Kuvrio"   ejstin   oJ   uiJo;"   tou`   ajnqrwvpou   kai;   tou ̀  sabbavtou. 
  so then     Lord           is      the   Son      the        of man       also     the     of sabbath.  


