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Philippians 4:1-13 
Literal English Translation 
 
 
1 ¶ So then, my beloved and longed for 
brothers, my joy and crown, in this way 
stand firm in the Lord, beloved ones. 
 
2 I appeal to Euodias, and I appeal to 
Syntyche, to mind the same thing in the 
Lord. 
 
3 And I also ask you, genuine yoke-fellow, 
help them who struggled together with me 
in the gospel with Clement also, and the 
rest of my fellow-workers, of whose 
names are in the Book of Life. 
 
4 Continually be satisfied in the Lord 
always. Again I will say, Continually be 
satisfied! 
 
5 Let your moderation become known to 
all men.  The Lord is near. 
 
6 Do not be anxious about one thing, but 
in everything by prayer and by petition 
with thanksgiving, let your requests 
become known to God; 
 
7 and the peace of God which surpasses 
all understanding will guard your hearts 
and your minds in Christ Jesus. 
 
8 The remaining, brothers, whatever 
things are true, whatever things are 
honorable, whatever things are just, 
whatever things are pure, whatever things 
are pleasing, whatever things are of good 
report, if any virtue, and if any praise, 
meditate on these things. 
 
9 What things also you learned and 
received and heard and saw in me, these 
things practice; and the God of peace will 
be with you. 
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Philippians 4:1-13 
Literal English Translation (continued) 
 
10 ¶ Now I rejoiced in the Lord greatly 
that already once again you revived to 
think on behalf of me, upon which you 
were also thinking, but you were without 
opportunity. 
 
11 Not that I am speaking according to 
lack, for I myself learned to be content in 
what condition I am in. 
 
12 I know both to be humbled, and I 
know to abound; in everything, and in all 
things, I have been initiated both to be 
satisfied and to hunger, both to abound, 
and to be lacking. 
 
13 I am strong for all things in  the Christ 
empowering me. 
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Philippians 4:10-13 
Greek / English Interlinear 
 
 
10) jEcavrhn    de;   ejn   Kurivw/   megavlw",   o{ti   h[dh       pote;     ajneqavlete   to;      
 I rejoiced   now   in      Lord        greatly,       that  already   once again   you revived   the    
 
 uJpe;r          ejmoù   froneiǹ:   ejfÆ      w|/      kai;       ejfroneit̀e,     
 on behalf of    me       to think;    upon    which    also   you were thinking,    
 
 hjkaireis̀qe           dev, 
 without opportunity   but,    
 
 
11) oujc   o{ti        kaqÆ     uJstevrhsin   levgw:     ejgw;    ga;r   e[maqon,   ejn    oi|"   
 not     that    according to        lack         I speak;    myself   for     I learned,    in     what    
 
 eijmi,   aujtavrkh"   ei\nai.  
 I am,        content        to be. 
 
 
12) oi\da     (de;)     kai;   tapeinoùsqai,   oi\da    kai;   perisseuvein:   ejn    
 I know   (and)      also     to be humbled,    I know   also       to abound;         in    
 
 panti;       kai;   ejn   pas̀i(n)         memuvhmai        kai;   cortavzesqai   kai;   
 everything   and    in     all things   I have been initiated    both    to be satisfied     and    
 
 peinaǹ,    kai;   perisseuvein   kai;   uJstereis̀qai:  
 to hunger,   both      to abound         and    to be lacking; 
 
 
13) pavnta        ijscuvw     ejn   tẁ/   ejndunamoùnti   me   [Cristw/̀]. 
 all things   I am strong    in     the      empowering       me      [Christ].  
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Philippians 4:10-13 
Diagram 
 
10)    jEcavrhn  
   I rejoiced 
 
   de;  
  now 
    ejn   Kurivw/  
    in       Lord 
 
         megavlw",  
             greatly, 
 
     o{ti  
      that 
           h[dh  
           already 
 
          pote;  
        once again 
 
      ajneqavlete  
       you revived 
 
      to;  
      the 
 
      uJpe;r      ejmoù  
            on behalf of    me 
 
          froneiǹ:  
             to think; 
 
 
      ejfÆ      w|/  
     upon    which 
 
     kai;  
     also 
 
    ejfroneit̀e,  
          you were thinking, 
 
           hjkaireis̀qe  
      without opportunity 
 
           dev. 
             but. 
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Philippians 4:10-13 
Diagram (continued) 
  
11)    oujc 
     not 
 
          o{ti  
            that 
 
          kaqÆ    uJstevrhsin  
     according to      lack 
 
           levgw:  
            I speak; 
 
           ejgw;  
           myself 
 
    ga;r  
     for 
 
    e[maqon,  
    I learned, 
 
      ejn  oi|"  
      in   what 
 
            eijmi,  
              I am, 
 
         aujtavrkh" 
            content 
 
         ei\nai.  
           to be. 
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Philippians 4:10-13 
Diagram (continued) 
 
12)    oi\da  
   I know   
 (de;)  
 (and) 
   kai;  
              also 
    tapeinoùsqai,  
      to be humbled, 
    oi\da  
   I know 
 
   kai;  
   also 
    perisseuvein:  
        to abound; 
 
    ejn   panti;  
    in   everything 
 
            kai;  
               and 
 
    ejn   pas̀i(n)  
    in    all things 
           memuvhmai  
      I have been initiated 
     kai;  
     both 
 
    cortavzesqai  
    to be satisfied 
 
           kai;  
             and 
 
        peinaǹ,  
         to hunger, 
         kai;  
          both 
 
    perisseuvein  
       to abound 
 
         kai;  
          and 
 
    uJstereis̀qai: 
    to be lacking;
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Philippians 4:10-13 
Diagram (continued) 
 
13)         pavnta  
         all things 
 
   ijscuvw  
          I am strong 
 
           ejn  
              in 
 
      tẁ/  
       the 
 
         ejndunamoùnti 
             empowering 
 
       me  
      me 
 
           [Cristẁ/]. 
             [Christ]. 
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